
CUSTOMS TARIFF
(CANADA PREFERENCE) (No. 2),

No. 52 of 1961.

An Act to amend the Customs Tariff (Canada
Preference) 1960, as amended by the Customs
Tariff (Canada Preference) 1961.

[Assented to 24th October, 1961.]
BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, the

Senate, and the House of Representatives of the
Commonwealth of Australia, as follows:-

S.-(l.) This Act may be cited as the Customs Tariff (Canada short title

Preference) (No. 2) 1961. and citation.

(2.) The Customs Tariff (Canada Preference) 1960,* as
amended by the Customs Tariff (Canada Preference) 1961,t is in
this Act referred to as the Principal Act.

* Act No. 54, 1960.
t Act No. 23, 1961.



No. 52. Customs Tariff (Canada Preference) (No. 2).

(3.) Section one of the Customs Tariff (Canada Preference)
1961 is amended by omitting sub-section (3.).

(4.) The Principal Act, as amended by this Act, may be cited
as the Customs Tariff (Canada Preference) 1960-1961.

Commence- 2. Except as otherwise provided in this Act, this Act shall
merit. come into operation on the day on which it receives the Royal

Assent.
Amendments 3.-(1.) The Second Schedule to the Principal Act is amendedof the Second

Shedle to as set out in the First, Second and Third Schedules to this Act.
the Principal
Act. (2.) The amendments set out in the First Schedule to this

Act shall be deemed to have come into operation on the thirtieth
day of June, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-one.

(3.) The amendments set out in the Second Schedule to this
Act shall be deemed to have come into operation on the second
day of August, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-one.

(4.) The amendment set out in the Third Schedule to this
Act shall be deemed to have come into operation on the fifteenth
day of September, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-one.

THE SCHEDULES.

FIRST SCHEDULE. Section 3.

AMENDMENTS OF THE SECOND SCHEDULE TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT.

1. Omit the figures and letter in column 2 opposite to consecutive number 19 in column 1, insert the
following figures and letters:-

" 178 (c) (1) (b)".

2. After consecutive number 49 in column I and the particulars in columns 2 and 3 opposite to that
consecutive number insert the following consecutive numbers and particulars:-

" 49A " " 353 (E) (3) (b).. .. Omit '271 per cent.', insert ' 30 per cent.'.

" 49B . 354 (B) (2) .. .. Omit '271 per cent.', insert * 30 per cent.'.

"49c 355 (A) .. .. Omit ' Free ', insert ' 22+ per cent.'."

SECOND SCHEDULE. Section 3.

AMENDMENTS OF THE SECOND SCHEDULE TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT.

1. Omit the words in column 4 opposite to consecutive number 43 in column 1.

2. After consecutive number 47 in column 1 and the particulars in columns 2 and 3 opposite to that
consecutive number insert the following consecutive numbers and particulars:-

" 47A .. 334 (o) (6) (a) .. Omit' £19 ', insert ' £21 '. . Cartridge paper.

" 47B .. 334 (G) (6) (b) .. Omit ' £19', insert' £21 '. .. Cartridge paper."

THIRD SCHEDULE. Section 3.

AMENDMENT OF THE SECOND SCHEDULE TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT.

After consecutive number 61 in column 1 and the particulars in columns 2 and 3 opposite to that
consecutive number insert the following consecutive number and particulars:-
" 61A .. 1 368 (A) (4) (C).. .. I Omit' 27+ per cent.', insert' 30 per cent.'."

1961.




