
272 

p&11D .... .., 
OommoDweal .. 
byapproncl 
aut.hor'tIII. 

Preamble. 

ilhon tltl. 
aDd cltatlOD. 

No. 35. Superannuation. 1947. 

to the difference between the amount paid to them under section 
sixty z of the Principal Act and the ,amount which would have been 
paid to them if that section of the Principal Act, as amended by this 
Act, had been in force at the time of the death of the contributor. 

(7.) Where a contributor to whose widow sub-section (5.) of this 
section applies, or a contributor to whose children the last preceding 
sub-section applies, has died not less than one year prior to the 
commencement of this Act, the additional amount payable to the 
widow in pursuance of sub-section (5.) of this section, or to the children 
in pursuance of the last preceding sub-section, shall be reduced, in 
respect of each complete year which has elapsed since the date of the 
death of the contributor, by an amount equal 'to one per centum of 
the amount paid to her or to them under section sixty z of the Principal 
Act. 

(8.) Where a widow referred to in sub-section (5.) of this section 
has died prior to the commencement of this Act and is survived by 
children under the age of sixteen years, payment of the amount 
which would have been paid to her if she had died after the commence
ment of this Act shall be divided equally amongst those children. 

(9.) The Commonwealth shall pay to the Provident Account 
the amount of any payments made from the Provident Account 
under this section and the Consolidated Revenue Fund is, to the 
necessary extent, hereby appropriated accordingly. 

33. Where any amount is payable by the Commonwealth under 
any of the last three preceding sections to the Superannuation 
Fund or to the Provident Account in respect of a person who was or 
is a person employed by an approved authority, the approved 
authority shall pay to the Commonwealth the amount so paid by the 
Commonwealth and may apply for that purpose any moneys under 
the control of the approved authority. 

PARI.lIAjIENTARY ALLQW ANOES. 

No. 36 of 1947. 

An Act to amend the Parliamentary AllouJanc~ 
A et 1920·1938, and for other purposes. 

[Assented to 12th June, 1947.] 
[Date of commencement, loth July, 1947.] 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, the Senate, 
and the House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of 

Australia, for the purpose of appropriating the grant originated in 
the House of Representatives, as follows :-

1.-(1.) This Act may be cited as the Parliamentary Allowances 
Act 1947. 



1947. Parliamentary Allowances. No. 36. 

(2.) The Parliamentary Allowances Act 1920-1938* is in this Act 
referred to as the Principal Act. 

(3.) The Principal Act, as amended by this Act, may be cited 
as the Parliamentary Allowances Act 1920-1947. 

2. Section three of the Principal Act is amended by omitting the 
words " One thousand pounds" and inserting in their stead the words 
"One thousand five hundred pounds". 

3. Section seven of the Principal Act is amended-
(a) by omitting the words" Two hundred pounds" and inserting 

in their stead the words" Three hundred pounds"; and 
(b) by omitting the words" Four hundred pounds" and inserting 

in. their stead the words " Six hundred pounds". 

273 

Allowan_ kl 
Leaders of 
0pJlOIIUos. 

4. Allowances at the rate fixed by sections three and seven of Comma_mul 

the Principal Act, as amended by this Act, shall commence to be ~~ :=~;:.t:
payable on the first day of July One thousand nine hundred and 
forty-seven. 

• Act No. 12, 1920, as amended by No. 9, 1928 and No. 2, 1938. 

SUPPLY (NO. 1) 1947-48. 

No. 37 of 1947. 

An Act to grant and apply a sum out of the 
Consolidated Revenue Fund for the service 
of the year ending the thirtieth day of June. 
One thousand nine hundred and forty-eight. 

[Assented to 12th June, 1947.] 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, the Senate, Preamble 

and the House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of 
Australia, for the purpose of appropriating the grant originated in 
the House of Representatives, as follows :-

1. This Act may be cited as the Supply Act (No. 1) 1947-48. SborUIU •. 

~ 
2. This Act shall come into operation on th~ day on which it Commencemen 

receives the Royal Assent. 

3. There shall and may be issued and applied for or towards Issue and 

making good the supply hereby granted to His Majesty for the ~gK1;~~~1 
service of the year ending the thirtieth day of June, One thousand 
nine hundred and forty-eight the sum of Sixty-eight million one 
hundred and eighty-nine thousand pounds out of the Consolidated 


