
1947. Parliamentary Allowances. No. 36. 

(2.) The Parliamentary Allowances Act 1920-1938* is in this Act 
referred to as the Principal Act. 

(3.) The Principal Act, as amended by this Act, may be cited 
as the Parliamentary Allowances Act 1920-1947. 

2. Section three of the Principal Act is amended by omitting the 
words " One thousand pounds" and inserting in their stead the words 
"One thousand five hundred pounds". 

3. Section seven of the Principal Act is amended-
(a) by omitting the words" Two hundred pounds" and inserting 

in their stead the words" Three hundred pounds"; and 
(b) by omitting the words" Four hundred pounds" and inserting 

in. their stead the words " Six hundred pounds". 

273 

Allowan_ kl 
Leaders of 
0pJlOIIUos. 

4. Allowances at the rate fixed by sections three and seven of Comma_mul 

the Principal Act, as amended by this Act, shall commence to be ~~ :=~;:.t:
payable on the first day of July One thousand nine hundred and 
forty-seven. 

• Act No. 12, 1920, as amended by No. 9, 1928 and No. 2, 1938. 

SUPPLY (NO. 1) 1947-48. 

No. 37 of 1947. 

An Act to grant and apply a sum out of the 
Consolidated Revenue Fund for the service 
of the year ending the thirtieth day of June. 
One thousand nine hundred and forty-eight. 

[Assented to 12th June, 1947.] 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, the Senate, Preamble 

and the House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of 
Australia, for the purpose of appropriating the grant originated in 
the House of Representatives, as follows :-

1. This Act may be cited as the Supply Act (No. 1) 1947-48. SborUIU •. 

~ 
2. This Act shall come into operation on th~ day on which it Commencemen 

receives the Royal Assent. 

3. There shall and may be issued and applied for or towards Issue and 

making good the supply hereby granted to His Majesty for the ~gK1;~~~1 
service of the year ending the thirtieth day of June, One thousand 
nine hundred and forty-eight the sum of Sixty-eight million one 
hundred and eighty-nine thousand pounds out of the Consolidated 



274 

~nm avaUabl. 
(or the purPOll .. 
'etforth In 
~"bedule. 

Wml' 01 period 
.f pxpendlture. 

No. 37. Supply (No. 1) 1947-48. 1947. 

Revenue Fund for the purposes and services expressed in the 
Schedule to this Act, and the Treasurer is hereby authorized and 
empowered to issue and apply the moneys authorized to be issued 
and applied. 

4. The sum specified in the last preceding section shall be available 
to satisfv the warrants under the hand of the Governor-General in 
respect ~f any purposes and services expressed in the Schedule to 
this Act. 

5. No money shall be expended under the authority of this Act 
after the thirtieth day of June, One thousand nine hundred and 
forty-eight. 

THE SCHEDULE. 

ABSTRACT. 

PART I.-DEPARTMENTS AND SERVICES-OTHER THAN BUSINESS 
UNDERTAKINGS AND TERRITORIES OF THE COMMON·. 
WEALTH. 

PARLIAMENT . . . . 
PRIME :MINISTER'S DEPARTMENT .. 
DEPARTMENT OF EXTERNAL AFFAIRS 
DEPARTMENT OF THE TREASURY .. 
ATTORNEY-GENERAL'S DEPARTMENT 
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR .. 
DEPARTMENT Ol!~ WORKS AND HOUSING .. 
DEPARTl\IENT OF CIVIL AVIATION 
DEPARTMENT OF TRADE AND CUSTOMS .. 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH.. .. ., .. 
DEPARTMENT OF COMIIfERCE AND AGRICULTURE .. 
DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES .. 
DEPARTMENT OF SUPPLY AND SHIPPING .. 
DEPARTMENT OF EXTERNAL TERRITORIES 
DEPARTMENT OF IMl\IIGRATION ., . . . . 
DEPARTl\fENT OF LABOUR AND NATIONAL SERVICE 
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORT 
DEPARTMENT OF INFORMATION ., .. 
DEPARTl\fENT OF POST-WAR RECONSTRUCTION 
DEFENCE AND POST-WAR (1939-45) CHARGES-

DEFENCE AND SERVICE DEPARTMENTS .. 
PRODUCTION DEPARTMENTS .. .. 
RE-ESTABLISHMENT AND REPATRIATION 
UNITED NATIONS RELIEF AND REHABILITA-

TION ADMINISTRATION .. 
SUBSIDIES " 
MISCELLANEOUS " .. 
MISCELLANEOUS CREDITS 

MISCELLANEOUS SERVICES 
WAR (1914-18) SERVICES 

£ 
19,770,000 ' 
4,782,000 
9,495,000 

3,000,000 
8,392,000 

561,000 
Cr. 6,000,000 

Total. 

£ 
79,460 

718,190 
257,520 
943,570 
167,210 
361,570 
583,210 
705,720 
400,770 

81,430 
176,520 
240,310 
104,910 

17,780 
234,330 
364-,500 

23,210 
1l0,64(1 
207,300 

40,000,000 

146,220 
230,630 

TOTAL PART 1 .. 46,155,000 



1947. Supply (No. 1) 1947-48. 

THE SCHEDULE-continued. 
ABSTRACT-continued. 

-----

--

PART 2.-BUSINESS UNDERTAKINGS. 

WEALTH RAILWAYS .. COMMON 
POSTMA STER-GENERAL'S DEPARTMENT 

TOTAL PART 2 .. 

· . 
· . 
.. 

· . 
· . 

· . 

PART 3.-TERRITORIES OF THE COMMONWEALTH. 

RN TERRITORY .. · . 
LIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY 

~ORTHE 
AUSTRA 
PAPUA-N 
~ORFOL 

EW GUINEA .. 
K ISLAND .. .. 

TOTAL PART 3 

S OF REVENUE REFUND 
ADVANC E TO THE TREASURER 

TOTAL 

--------- --. 

.. 
· . 

· . 

· . 
.. 
.. 

.. · . 

.. · . 
· . · . 
· . · . 

· . · . 

.. · . 
· . · . 

.. .. 

WAR SERVIOE HOMES. 

No. 38 of 1947. 

No. 37. 

Total. 

£ 

.. 490,000 

.. 8,664,000 

.. 9,154,000 

.. 269,000 

. . 210,000 

.. 400,000 

.. 1,000 

.. 880,000 

. . 3,000,000 

.. 9,000,000 

.. 68,189,000 
._---

An Act to amend the War Service Homes Act 
1918-1947, and for other purposes. 

[Assented to 12th June, 1947.] 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, the Senate, 
. and the House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of 

Australia, as follows:-

1.-(1.) This Act may be cited as the War Service Homes Act 
1947. 

(2.) Section five of the Commonwealth Public Service Act 1947* 
IS amended by omitting sub-section (3.). 

(3.) The War Service Homes Act 1918-1946t, as amended by the 
Commonwealth Public Service Act 1947, is in this Act referred to as 
the Principal Act. 

(4.) The Principal Act, as amended by this Act, may be cited aR 
the War Service Homes Act 1918-1947. 

Act No. 1, 1947. 
tAct "10. 43, 1918, as amended by No. 28,1919; No. 25, 1920; No. 18, 1923; No. 26,1926: 

So. 47, 1926; No. 17, 1927; No. 13, 1929: Nos. 6 and 68, 1932: No. 63, 1934: No. 54, 1935; 
No. 25, 1937; No. 1, 1941 ; and No. 8, IQ46. 

270 


