
1926. States Loan. No. 35. 

STATES LOAN. 

No. 35 of 1926. 

An Act to amend the States LO~ln Act 1925. 

[Assented to 11th August, 1926.J 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, the Senate, 
and the House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of 

Australia, as follows :-

1.-(1.) This Act may be cited as the States Loan Act 1926. 
(2.) The States Loan Act 1925* is in this Act referred to as the 

Principal' Act. 
(3.) The Principal Act, as amended by this Act, may be cited 

as the States Loan Act 19:25-1926. ' 

2. Section two of the Principal Act is amended by omitting the 
words "One thousand nine hundred and twenty-six" (wherever 
occurring) and inserting in their stead the words "One thousand 
nine hundred and twenty-seven". 

3. Section six of the Principal Ac:t is amended by omitting the 
word,; " One thOUSU,lld nine hundred <Lnd twenty-six" and 
inserting in their stead the words " One thousand nine hundred and 
twentY-Reven ". 

• Act No. 6, 1925. 

SHALE OIL BOUNTY. 

No. 36 of 1926. 

An Act to amend the Shale Oil Bounty Act 
1917-1923. 

[Assented to 11th August, 1926.J 

B E it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, the Senate, 
and the House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of 

Australia, for the purpose of appropriating the grant originated in 
the House of Representatives, as follows :-

131 

Short title and 
citation. 

Agreement, 
with States, 

Conversion of 
State 
EPcurities into 
Commonwealtl; 
securities. 

Preamble. 

1.-(1.) This Act may be cited as the Shale Oil Bounty Act 1926. ShorttiUe 
and citatIon. 



132 No. 36. Shale Oil Bounty. 1926. 

(2.) The Shale Oil Bounty Act 1917-1923* is in this Act referred to 
as the Principal Act. 

(3.) The Principal Act, as amended by this Act, may be cited as the 
Shale Oil Bounty Act 1917-1926. 

Extension 2. Section two of the Principal Act is amended by omitting the 
~~~~h1eh words" nine years" and inserting in their stead the words "twelve 
bounty payable. years". 

Specification 
of bounty. 

Amendment 
of Schedule. 

Short title and 
citation. 

3. Section three of the Principal Act is amended by omitting the 
words "nine years " and inserting in their stead the words "twelve 
years" . 

4. The Schedule to the Principal Act is amended-
(a) by omitting from the second column the figure "9" and 

inserting in its stead the figures " 12 " ; and 
(b) by omitting from the fourth column the figures " 1926 " and 

inserting in their stead the figures" 1929 " . 

• Act No. 29, 1917, as amended by No. 6, 1921 ; No. 40, 1922; aud No. 23, 1923. 

COMMERCE (TRADE DESCRlprrIONS). 

No. 37 of 1926. 

An Act to amend section fifteen of the Commerce 
(Tmde Descriptions) Act 1905. 

[Assented to 11th August, 1926.J 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, the Senate, 
and the House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of 

Australia, as follows :-

1.-(1.) This Act may be cited as the Commerce (Trade 
Descriptions) Act 1926. 

(2.) The Commerce (Trade Descriptions) Act 1906,* as amended 
by this Act, may be cited as the Commerce (Trade Descriptions) 
Act 1905-) 926. 

Application of 2. Section fifteen of the C(lmmerce (Trade Descriptions) Act 
~~~tions 7 and 1905 is amended by adding at the end thereof the following para­

graph :-
" ; or (g) brushware." . 

• Act No. 16, 1905. 


