
1974 Licensing (Fees) No. 44 

LICENSING (FEES) 

No. 44 of 1974 

ANALYSIS 
1. Short title, citation, and commencement. 
2. Fees payable in respect of licences. 
3. Fees payable in respect of certificates. 

AN ACT to amend the Licensing Act 1932 with respect to the fees 
to be paid thereunder. 

[14 October 1974] 

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor of Tasmania, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 

House of Assembly, in Parliament assembled, as follows:-

231 

1-(1) This Act may be cited as the Licensing (Fees) Act 1974. ~fl~~o~:l=~d 

(2) The Licensing Act 1932, as subsequently amended, is in 
commencement. 

this Act referred to as the Principal Act. 

( 3) This Act shall commence on 1 st July 1975. 



232 

Fees payable 
in respect 
of licences. 

Fees payable 
in respect of 
certificates. 

No. 44 Licensing (Fees) 1974 

2 Section 24 of the Principal Act is amended-
(a) by omitting from subsection (lA) the words" six per cent" 

and substituting therefor " 8 per cent "; 
(b) by omitting from subsection (lB) the words" six per cent" 

and substituting therefor " 8 per cent"; and 
( c) by omitting from subsection (5) the words " six per cent" 

and substituting therefor " 8 per cent". 

3 Section 79 of the Principal Act is amended-
( a) by omitting from subsection (2) the words " six per cent " 

and substituting therefor " 8 per cent "; and 
(b) by omitting from subsection (3) the words" six per cent" 

and substituting therefor " 8 per cent". 


