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Sir Charles Augustus FitzRoy 

(3 August 1846 – 20 January 1855) 

John Kennedy McLaughlin 

Falling deeply into debt 

The Ducal house of Grafton had its origins in the relationship between 
King Charles II and Barbara Villiers, Duchess of Cleveland. One of the 
offspring of that liaison, Henry, known by the surname FitzRoy, was 
ennobled in 1672 when aged nine, and three years later, in 1675, was 
created Duke of Grafton. The second son of the third Duke of Grafton was 
General Lord Charles FitzRoy. His first son, Charles Augustus (by 
Frances, daughter of Edward Miller-Mundy MP of Shipley, Derbyshire) 
was born on 10 June 1796 in Derbyshire, England. By marriage to the 
eldest daughter of Charles, fourth Duke of Richmond, and Charlotte, 
daughter of Alexander, fourth Duke of Gordon, Charles Augustus FitzRoy 
allied himself with two further Ducal houses.1 

Aristocratic birth and connections encouraged an expensive and 
ostentatious lifestyle that could not be well maintained without an in-
come. Charles Augustus, throughout his life, rarely managed to live within 

his means. In due course that would provide grist for the mills of his de-
tractors in New South Wales, particularly JD Lang – an implacable critic – 

who claimed that FitzRoy “was a man with neither head nor heart”: 

By orders from home we had to pay him 5000l. a year with various 
valuable perquisites besides, for governing the colony; but as he was 
universally understood to be somewhat effete and incapable in matters  
of government, we had to pay 1500l. a year to a colonial secretary, as 
Governor’s keeper; the latter doing most of the work, without sharing the 
responsibility.2 

Charles Augustus was educated at Harrow – though not in the art of 
calligraphy, his handwriting always being formless and at times illegible. 
In April 1812, aged not yet 16, he was commissioned an Ensign in the 
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